The I\/Iizorm Gazette

EXTRA ORDINARY
Published by Authority

RNINo. 27009/1973 Postal Regn. No. NE-313(MZ) 2006-2008 Re. 1/- per page
VOL - XLI Aizawl, Tuesday 20.3.2012 Phalguna 30, S.E. 1933, Issue No. 140

NOTIFICATION

No. H. 12019/1/2004-PAD, the 7" March, 2012.  In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section
(1) of section 19 of the Mizoram Salaries, Allowances and Pension of Members of the Legislative Assembly
Act, 1999, (Act No. 5 of 1999) read with section 14 thereof, the Governor of Mizoram is pleased to make the
following rules, namely :-

1 Short Title and (1) These Rules may be called the Mizoram Legislative Assembly (Grant
Commencement of Loans and Advances to Members) (Third Amendment) Rules, 2011.
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 1 day of August, 2010.

2. Amendment of Rule 4 In Rule 4 of the Mizoram Legislative Assembly (Grant of Loans and
Advances to Members) Rules, 2000 (hereinafter referred to as the
Principal Rules) for the words “five lakh rupees” the words “ten
lakh rupees” shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of Rule 6 In Rule 6 of the Principal Rules, for the words “five lakh rupees” the
words “ten lakh rupees” shall be substituted.

4. Amendment of Rule 10 (1) Insub-rule (1) of Rule 10 of the Principal Rules, for the words “within
a period of twenty years” the words “so that the recovery period of
such loan shall not exceed 10 (ten) years”, shall be substituted.

(2)  Insub-rule (2) of Rule 10 of the Principal Rules, for the words “within
a period of twenty years” the words “so that the recovery period of
such loan shall not exceed 10 (ten) years” shall be substituted.

(3) Insecond proviso of sub-rule (2) of Rule 10 of the Principal Rules,
for the words “twenty years” the words “ten years” shall be substituted.

By Order, etc.
P. Singthanga,

Secretary to the Govt. of Mizoram,
Parliamentary Affairs Department.

Published and Issued by Controller, Printing & Stationery Department, Government of Mizoram
Printed at the Mizoram Government Press, Aizawl. C/500



