The Mizorwgm Gazette

EXTRA ORDINARY
Published by Authority

RNINo. 27009/1973 Postal Regn. No. NE-313(MZ) 2006-2008
VOL - XLIIl  Aizawl, Friday 22.8.2014 Sravana 31, S.E. 1936, Issue No. 425

NOTIFICATION

No.A. 26020/1/2009-DCA, the 4™ August, 2014. In pursuance of paragraph 11 of the Sixth
Schedule to the Constitution of India, the Amendment Rules passed by the Chakma Autonomous District
Council which received approval of His Excellency the Governor of Mizoram on 21.3.2014 and vetted by
Finance Department vide I.D. No. FIN(E) 313/2014 dt. 28.7.2014 is hereby published for general information,
namely :-

“THE CHAKMA AUTONOMOUS DISTRICT COUNCIL (SALARIES & ALLOWANCES
OF CHIEF EXECUTIVE MEMBER/EXECUTIVE MEMBER/ADVISER TO CHIEF
EXECUTIVE MEMBER/CHAIRMAN/DEPUTY CHAIRMAN/VICE CHAIRMAN,
(PLANNING)/OPPOSITION LEADER/MEMBER AND PENSION OF MEMBER)
(AMENDMENT) RULES, 2012”.

P. Singthanga,
Secretary to the Govt. of Mizoram,
District Council Affairs Department.



Ex-425/2014

-2

THE CHAKMA AUTONOMOUS DISTRICT COUNCIL (SALARIES AND
ALLOWANCES OF CHIEF EXECUTIVE MEMBER AND EXECUTIVE MEMBERS
(AMENDMENT RULES) 2012.

A
RULES

further to amend the Chakma Autonomous District Council (Salaries and Allowances of Chief Executive
Member and Executive Members) Rules, 2003 (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Rules).

Be it enacted by the Chakma Autonomous District Council in the Sixty-Third Year of Republic of

India as follows:-

Short title and
commencement

Amendment of
Rule 2.

Amendment of
Rule 3.

Amendment of
Rule 4.

1.

(1)

()

These rules may be called the Chakma Autonomous District Council
(Salaries and Allowances of the Chief Executive Member and Executive
Members etc. (Amendment) Rules, 2012.

They shall come into force with retrospective effect from 1 April 2012.

After Rule 2 (g) of the principal Rules, the following definition shall be
inserted, namely,

(h)

(i)

0)

“Adviser to Chief Executive Member” means a person who is appointed
to assist the Chief Executive Member of the Chakma Autonomous
District Council in certain functions.

“Opposition Leader” means the leader of the opposition members
having one-third of the elected members from a single recognised or
registered Political Party.

“Vice-Chairman (Planning)” means a person who is appointed as
Vice Chairman (Planning) of the Chakma Autonomous District Council”.

In Rule 3 of the Principal Rules:-

(i)

For the words “Chief Executive Member and Executive Members”,

the words and brackets “Chief Executive Member, Executive Members,
Opposition Leader, Adviser to Chief Executive Member and Vice-
Chairman (Planning)” shall be substituted.

Rule 4 of the Principal Rules shall be substituted as follows, namely,
“4 (1) There shall be paid to the Chief Executive Member a sumptuary
allowances of Rs. 7,000/-(Rupees seven thousand) only and to Executive
Members, Opposition Leader, Adviser to Chief Executive Member
and Vice-Chairman (Planning) Rs. 6,000/-(Rupees six thousand) only
each per mensem.

(2) There shall be paid to the Chief Executive Member a family
allowances of Rs. 6,000/-(Rupees six thousand) only and to Executive
Members, Opposition Leader, Adviser to Chief Executive Member
and Vice-Chairman (Planning) Rs. 4,000/-(Rupees four thousand)
only each per mensem.

(3) There shall be paid to the Chief Executive Member an entertainment
allowances of Rs. 4,000/-(Rupees four thousand) only and to Executive
Members, Opposition Leader, Adviser to Chief Executive Member
and Vice-Chairman (Planning) Rs. 3,000/-(Rupees three thousand)
only each per mensem.



Amendment of 5.
Rule 5.

Explanation:
Amendment of 6.
Rule 6.
Amendment of 7.
Rule 7.
Amendment of 8.
Rule 8.
Amendment of 9.
Rule 10.
Amendment of 10.
Rule 11.
Amendment of 11.
Rule 12.

-3- Ex-425/2014

Rule 5 of the Principal Rules shall be substituted as follows, namely:-

“5. The Chief Executive Member, Executive Members, Opposition
Leader, Adviser to Chief Executive Member and Vice-Chairman (Planning)”
shall be entitled without any payment to the use and maintenance of a
furnished residence throughout their terms of office and for a period of
fifteen days immediately thereafter.

Provided that they shall be entitled to residence for which rental charge
shall not be more than Rs. 5,000/-(Rupees five thousand) only per mensem
and there shall be made available a sum of Rs. 50,000/- (Rupees fifty thousand)
only for furnishing residence in the first year and Rs. 25,000/- (Rupees
twenty five thousand) only annually for the subsequent years.

Provided further that the payment rate for electricity, calls of telephone,
free water supply, local rates and taxes shall be fixed by the Chief Executive
Member.

“Maintenance” in relation to residence includes,

(i)  Provision of electricity and free water supply.
(i)  Provision of free telephone calls, and

(ii))  Provision of local rates and taxes”.

In Rule 6 of the Principal Rules, after the words “the Executive Members,”
the words and brackets “Opposition Leader, Adviser to Chief Executive
Member and Vice-Chairman (Planning)” shall be inserted.

In Rule 7 of the Principal Rules, after the words “the Executive Members”,
the words and brackets “Opposition Leaders, Adviser to Chief Executive
Member and Vice-Chairman (Planning)” shall be inserted.

Rule 8 of the Principal Rules, after the words “the Executive Members”,
the words and brackets “Opposition Leaders, Adviser to Chief Executive
Member and Vice-Chairman (Planning)” shall be inserted and the words
“recognised by the District Council” shall be substituted by “in any Hospitals,
Nursing Homes and Clinics”.

InRule 10 of the Principal Rules, after the words *“or Executive Members”,
the words and brackets *“or Opposition Leader, or Adviser to Chief Executive
Member or Vice-Chairman (Planning)” shall be inserted.

In Rule 11 of the Principal Rules, after the words “the Chief Executive Member™,
the words and brackets “the Executive Members, Adviser to Chief Executive
Member or Vice-Chairman (Planning)” shall be inserted.

Rule 12 of the Principal Rules shall be substituted as follows, namely;
“12. The Chief Executive Member shall be entitled to receive the
services of 3 (three) Grade IV staff and the Executive Members, Opposition
Leader, Adviser to Chief Executive Member and Vice-Chairman (Planning)”
shall be entitled to receive the services of 2 (two) Grade 1V staff each
according to their own choice. The rate of wages of grade IV staff shall be
revisable from time to time and their appointment shall be co-terminus”.



Ex-425/2014

Amendment of
Schedule

12.

-4 -

In Schedule of the Principal Rules, for the figures “Rs. 250/-"and “Rs. 300/-”,
the figures, brackets and words “Rs. 500/-(Rupees five hundred) only” and
“Rs. 750/-(Rupees seven hundred) only” respectively shall be substituted.

THE CHAKMA AUTONOMOUS DISTRICT COUNCIL (SALARIES AND
ALLOWANCES OF CHAIRMAN AND DEPUTY CHAIRMAN (AMENDMENT

RULES) 2012.

A
RULES

further to amend the Chakma Autonomous District Council (Salaries and Allowances of Chairman and
Deputy Chairman) Rules, 2003 (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Rules).

Be it enacted by the Chakma Autonomous District Council in the Sixty-Third Year of Republic of

India as follows:

Short title and
commencement

Amendment of
Rule 3.

Amendment of
Rule 4.

Amendment of
Rule 5.

(1)  These rules may be called the Chakma Autonomous District Council
(Salaries and Allowances of Chairman and Deputy Chairman (Amendment)
Rules, 2012.

(2)  They shall come into force with retrospective effect from 1 April 2012.

In Rule 3 of the Principal Rules, for the words “ten thousand”, the words
“forty thousand” shall be substituted.

Rule 4 of the Principal Rules shall be substituted as follows, namely;

“4. There shall be paid to the Chairman and the Deputy Chairman a
sumptuary allowances of Rs. 6,000/-(Rupees six thousand) only each per
mensem, family allowances of Rs. 5,000/-(Rupees five thousand) only in
respect of Chairman per mensem and Rs. 4,000/-(Rupees four thousand
thousand) only in respect of Deputy Chairman per mensem, and entertainment
allowances of Rs. 4,000/-(Rupees four thousand) only in respect of Chairman
and Rs. 3,000/-(Rupees three thousand) only in respect of Deputy Chairman
per mensem.

In Rule 5 of the Principal Rules,

()  For the words “three thousand five hundred rupees”, the figures,
words and brackets “Rs. 5,000/-(Rupees five thousand) only shall
be substituted.

(i)  For the figures, brackets and words “Rs. 40,000/- (Rupees forty
thousand)”, the figures, brackets and words “Rs. 50,000/-(Rupees
fifty thousand)” shall be substituted.

(i) For the figures, brackets and words “Rs. 5000/-(Rupees five thousand)”,
the figures, brackets and words Rs. 25,000/-(Rupees twenty five
thousand) shall be substituted.

(iv)  Provision to this Rule shall be inserted as follows, namely:

“ Provided that payment rate for electricity, calls of telephone,
free water supply and local rates and taxes shall be fixed by the
Chairman. However, such fixation shall be in conformity with the
Executive Committee”.



-5- Ex-425/2014

Amendment of 5. Rule 12 of the Principal Rules shall be substituted as follows, namely,

Rule 12. “5.  The Chairman shall be entitled to the services of 3 (three) Grade IV
staff and the Deputy Chairman shall be entitled to receive the services of
2 (two) Grade IV staff each according to their own choice. Wages shall be
paid as un-skilled labour. The rate of wages of Grade 1V staff shall be
revisable from time to time and their appointment shall be co-terminus”.

Amendment of 6. In Schedule of the Principal Rules,
Schedule (i)  for the figures “Rs. 250/-" the figures, brackets and words “Rs. 500/-
(Rupees five hundred) only” shall be substituted.
(i)  for the figures “Rs. 300/-”, the figures, brackets and words
“Rs. 750/-(Rupees seven hundred fifty) only” shall be substituted.

THE CHAKMA AUTONOMOUS DISTRICT COUNCIL
(SALARIES, ALLOWANCES AND PENSION OF MEMBERS)
(AMENDMENT ) RULES, 2012

A
RULES

further to amend the Chakma Autonomous District Council (Salaries, Allowances and pension of
Members) Rules, 2003 (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Rules).

Be it enacted by the Chakma Autonomous District Council in the sixty third year of the Republic of
India as follows:-

Short title and 1. (1)  These rules may be called the Chakma Autonomous District Council
commencement (Salaries Allowances and Pension of Members) (Amendment) Rules, 2012.
(2)  They shall come into force with retrospective effect from Ist April 2012.

Amendment of 2. In Rule 2 (g) of the Principal Rules, after the words “Executive Member”,
Rule 2. the words “Opposition Leader”, shall be inserted.

Amendment of 3. In Rule 3 of the Principal Rules, for the words “ten thousand rupees”, the
Rule 3. words “forty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Amendment of 4. Rule 5 of the Principal Rules shall be substituted as follows, namely:-
Rule 5. “5. Amember shall be paid a constituency allowances of Rs. 3000/- (Rupees

three thousand) only per mensem, family allowances of Rs. 3000/- (Rupees
three thousand) only per mensem and entertainment allowances of
Rs. 1500/- (Rupees one thousand five hundred) only per mensem.

Amendment of 5. Rule 6 of the Principal Rules, for the figures “Rs.2,500/-", the figures,

Rule 6. brackets and after the words “Rs. 4,000/- (Rupees four thousand) only
shall be substituted.

Amendment of 6. Rule 7 of the Principal Rules shall be substituted as follows, namely:-

Rule 7. “7. A member who occupies own house shall be entitled to receive a sum

of Rs. 30,000/- (Rupees thirty thousand ) only in the first year for furnishing
and Rs. 15,000/- (Rupees fifteen thousand ) only annually for the subsequent
years of the term:



Ex-425/2014

Amendment of
Rule 8.

Amendment of
Rule 9.

Amendment of
Rule 12.

Amendment of
Rule 13.

Amendment of
Rule 14.

-6 -

Provided that payment rate for electricity, calls of telephone, free
water supply and local rates or taxes shall be fixed by the Chairman from
time to time”.

7. Rule 8 of the Principal Rules shall be substituted as follows, namely:-

“8. Amember shall be entitled to the service of one Grade-1V staff as personal
Attendant according to his own choice and his wages shall be paid as un-
skilled labour per mensem. The rate of wages of Grade -1V staff shall be
revisable from time to time and the appointment shall be co-terminus”.

8. (1) Insubrule (1) of Rule 9 of the Principal Rules, for the words “ two

hundred fifty rupees”, the figures, brackets and words “Rs. 500/-
(Rupees five hundred) only” shall be substituted.

(2) Insub rule (3) of Rule 9 of the Principal Rules, for the figures
“Rs. 200/- “, the figures, brackets and words, “Rs. 750/- (Rupees
seven hundred fifty) only” shall be substituted.

9. Sub-rule (2) of Rule 12 of the Principal Rules shall be substituted as follows,

namely:-

“(2) (a) There shall be paid Rs. 20,000/- (Rupees twenty thousand ) only
per mensem to a member who had been elected /nominated once
for 5(five) year or for any period shorter than 5(five) years.

(b) There shall be paid Rs. 22,000/- (Rupees twenty two thousand)
only per mensem to a member who had been elected for three
terms or more before the commencement of these rules.

(c) Where any person has been re-elected after the commencement
of these rules for another term, whether he has completed the
term or not, he shall be entitled to an additional pension of Rs. 3,000/-
(Rupees three thousand) only per mensem.

(d) The pension shall be increased at the rate of 5% (five) percent
simple interest annually”.

10.  InRule 13 of the Principal Rules, for the words “one lakh rupees” the
words “five lakhs rupees” shall be substituted.

11. (1) Insubrule (1) of Rule 14 of the Principal Rules, for the word “ two
thousand five hundred rupees”, the word “ ten thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

(2) Inprovisoto Rule 14 of the Principal Rules, for the word, “ this
act”, the word, “these rules” shall be substituted.

Published and Issued by Controller, Printing & Stationery Department, Government of Mizoram

Printed at the Mizoram Government Press, Aizawl. C/150



